
Apt. in Dominion Beach 210 €
Reference: DB002  Bedrooms: 4  Bathrooms: 4
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Costa del Sol, New Golden Mile

Excep&onal 4 bedroom apartment in the fantas&c beachfront urbanisa&on, Dominion Beach. Fully renovated and
refurbished to a luxury standard, this beau&ful property is perfect for families and friends, ensuring all guests are
comfortable and relaxed. Dominion Beach offers 3 swimming pools, mature tropical gardens, direct beach and
promenade access, a summer restaurant, communal gym, and 24 hour security inside a gated complex. The master
bedroom features a king size bed facing a TV on the wall, direct access onto the terrace, plenty of storage space, and
an ensuite bathroom with large rainfall shower. The second bedroom is similar to the master, providing a king size bed,
direct access onto the terrace, plenty of storage, and an ensuite bathroom with bath/shower. The third bedroom has a
double bed, plenty of storage and an ensuite bathroom with walk-in shower. The fourth bedroom in located in the
basement and has a small double bed with ensuite bathroom with shower. The kitchen and living room are fully open
plan. The kitchen is well equipped with all the appliances and utensils expected of a luxury rental property, perfect for
those guests that enjoy cooking and entertaining. A breakfast bar with stools for 4 allows for informal ea&ng, while a
dining area with table and sea&ng for 6 is also provided. The living room features a large sofa and armchair facing a
smart TV (Ne:lix, Amazon Prime etc). The room is bathed in natural light through the window out onto the terrace.
Along with the fourth bedroom, the basement features a pool table and entertainment room, with L-shaped sofa and
armchair facing an enormous smart TV. The long terrace that runs the length of the apartment offers chillout sea&ng,
and alfresco dining area, and 2 sun loungers. The terrace looks out over the property’s private garden, which provides
an addi&onal 2 sun loungers, and allows easy access into the communal grounds of the urbanisa&on. All rooms in the
property have air condi&oning (hot and cold), and there is strong fibre op&c WIFI reachable throughout (100mbps).
Dominion Beach has a number of beach restaurants a short walk along the Paseo Mari&mo (beachfront promenade),
which connects Estepona with Marbella (lovely walk or cycle). For those guests wan&ng to explore further, it is
recommended to rent a car. Included in the rental of the property is access to gated parking.
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